
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XXIV Of 2023.

(First published, after having receicved the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 11th May 2023).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Fire Prevention and Life Safety
Measures Act, 2006.

WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Fire
Prevention and Life Safety Measures Act, 2006, for the purposes hereinafter
appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Fire Prevention and Life
Safety Measures (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

Short title
and
commencement.

Mah. III
of 2007.

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 9, +ÆEòú 26] MÉȪ û´ÉÉ®úúú, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ 37, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 42

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ  Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Fire Prevention and Life Safety Measures (Amendment) Act, 2023
(Mah. Act No. XXIV of 2023), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

————————

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---1 (1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945

2. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Fire Prevention and Life Safety Measures
Act, 2006 (hereinafter referred to as “ the principal Act ”),—

(1) in clause (1), for the Explanation, the following Explanation shall

be substituted, namely:—

“ Explanation.— For the purposes of this Act, the expression
“ building ” shall also include the temporary structure such as tents,
shamiyanas and the tarpaulin shelters erected for temporary and

ceremonial occasions ;”;

(2) in clause (4), for the words “ Fire Services ” the words “Fire and
Emergency Services” shall be substituted;

(3) after clause (4), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(4A) “ Fire and Emergency Services ” means services required
to be rendered by any local authority or planning authority or any
other such authority notified by the State Government, in case of
manmade or natural disaster or any eventuality, where the life or

property is at risk;” ;

(4) in clause (5), for the words and figures “National Building Code
of India, 2005 ” the words “National Building Code of India” shall be
substituted ;

(5) for clause (6), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :—

“(6) “Licensed Agency” means a person or an association of
persons licensed by the Director for undertaking or executing fire
prevention and life safety measures or performing such other related

activities required to be carried out under this Act;”;

(6) in clause (8), for the words and figures “National Building Code
of India, 2005” the words “National Building Code of India” shall be
substituted;

(7) in clause (9), for the words “ and includes an officer nominated by
a local authority or a planning authority” the words “ or by a local authority
or a planning authority ” shall be substituted ;

(8) for clause (14), the following clause shall be substituted,

namely :—

“ (14) “ relevant municipal law ” means,—

(a) the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act ;

(b) the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act ;

(c) the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats

and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 ;”.

Mah. III
of 2007.

III of
1888.
LIX of
1949.
Mah. XL
of 1965.

Amendment
of section 2 of

Mah. III of
2007.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 3

3.  In section 3 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1),—

(a)  for the portion beginning with the words “Without prejudice

to the provisions” and ending with the words “ provisions of this Act

or the rules ”, the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Without prejudice to the provisions of any law for the time

being in force or the rules, regulations or bye-laws made thereunder

or the National Building Code of India, relating to fire prevention

and life safety measures, the owner, or where the owner is not

traceable, the occupier of any building as classified in Schedule-I

or part of any such building, shall obtain necessary Provisional

Fire Safety Approval or Final Fire Safety Approval or Renewal of

Fire Safety Approval, as the case may be, from the Chief Fire

Officer of the concerned local authority or planning authority; and

where there is no Chief Fire Officer in such area or in the area

outside the limits of the local authority or planning authority,

from the Director. The owner or occupier shall provide fire

prevention and life safety measures as recommended in the

respective Fire Safety Approval, which shall not be less than the

minimum requirements of fire safety installations prescribed in

Part 4 of the National Building Code of India or any relevant Part

thereof and as specified against such building in Schedule-I as

applicable from time to time and shall maintain the fire prevention

and life safety measures in good repair and efficient condition at

all times, in accordance with the provisions of this Act and the

rules made thereunder:”;

(b) after the proviso, for the Explanation, the following

Explanation shall be substituted, namely :—

“Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section,—

(a) “Provisional Fire Safety Approval” means the

recommendation given by the Director or Chief Fire Officer

of the concerned local authority or planning authority as

per the fire prevention and life safety measures as provided

by or under this Act and the  rules made thereunder at the

time of building plan approval and  before the  construction

thereof;

(b) “Final Fire Safety Approval” means the certificate

issued by the Director or Chief Fire Officer of the concerned

Amendment
of section 3 of
Mah. III of
2007.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---1+



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945

local authority or planning authority after ascertaining  that

the fire prevention and life safety measures are in accordance

with Provisional Fire Safety Approval before granting

building completion certificate or occupancy certificate by

the appropriate authority;

(c) “Renewal of Fire Safety Approval” means the renewal

of a  certificate issued by the Director or Chief Fire Officer

of the concerned local authority or planning authority :

Provided that, renewal certificate shall be issued by

the said authority, if required or mandatory as per the

relevant Acts, Rules, etc.”;

(2) after sub-section (1A), the following sub-sections shall be inserted,

namely :—

“(1B) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) or

any other provisions of this Act or any other law for the time being

in force,—

(a) buildings above 30 meters in height but not exceeding 45

meters in height may be permitted in the areas of Municipal

Corporation and Special Planning Authority, in case of

occupancies specified as (B) in Schedule-I, that is to say

Educational Buildings, if such building fulfils the minimum

requirements of fire prevention and life safety measures as

recommended in the respective Fire Safety Approval and which

shall not be less than the minimum requirements for fire fighting

installations specified in the Schedule-I;

(b) in areas outside the limits of the Municipal Corporation

and Special Planning Authority, the State Government may

permit the authority empowered to sanction the construction

plan on its request, to issue such certificate, in respect of

buildings exceeding 30 meters in height in case of occupancies

specified as (B) in Schedule-I, that is to say Educational Buildings,

if such buildings fulfils the minimum requirements of fire

prevention and life safety measures as recommended in the

respective Fire Safety Approval and which shall not be less than

the minimum requirements for fire fighting installations

specified in Schedule-I;

(1C) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) or

any other provisions of this Act or any other law for the time being

in force, building above 15 meters in height but not exceeding 24



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 5

meters in height, Multi-Level Car Parking (MLCP)  upto 45 meters,

Mechanised Automated Car Parking attached to minimum one side

of the building or stand alone structure upto 100 meters, or any such

other structure used for utility purpose such as storage of Diesel

Generators (DG) Sets, may be permitted, in case of occupancies

specified as (H) in Schedule-I, that is to say storage buildings, if such

buildings fulfils the minimum requirements of fire  prevention and

life safety measures as recommended in the respective Fire Safety

Approval and which shall not be less than minimum requirements of

fire fighting installations specified in Schedule-I.”;

(3) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted,

namely :—

“(3A) For the building as specified under section 45, the owner,

or where the owner is not traceable, the occupier of a building, shall

ensure that the fire fighting systems as recommended in the relevant

Fire Safety Approval, is provided with automated continuous

monitoring system as may be prescribed for ensuring that the fire

fighting systems are in good repair and efficient working condition

and these shall be certified by the Licensed Agency in the prescribed

form and the manner and shall submit the same to the concerned

authority in the manner as may be prescribed.”.

4. In section 9 of the principal Act,—

(1) for the words “Chief Fire Officer”, wherever they occur, the word

“Director” shall be substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “a court-fee stamp of five rupees”

the words “such court-fee stamp as may be prescribed” shall be substituted ;

(3) in sub-section (3), for the words “one year” the words “two years”

shall be substituted ;

(4) sub-section (5) shall be deleted.

5.   In section 10 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in the proviso, for

the words “Chief Fire Officer” the word “Director” shall be substituted.

6. In section 11 of the principal Act,—

(1) for sub-sections (1) and (2), the following sub-sections shall be

substituted, namely :—

“(1) With effect from the date of commencement of the

Maharashtra Fire Prevention and Life Safety Measures (Amendment)

Act, 2023, and subject to the provisions of this Act, there shall be

Amendment
of section 9 of
Mah. III of
2007.

Amendment
of section 10
of Mah. III of
2007.

Amendment
of section 11
of Mah. III of
2007.

Mah.XXIV
of 2023.



6 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945

levied a Fire and Emergency Service Fee, for the purposes of this Act

on all owners or occupiers, as the case may be, of buildings as classified

in Schedule-II (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the said

Schedule”), within the areas of a local authority or a planning authority

(hereinafter, save as otherwise mentioned, throughout in this Act,

collectively referred to as “the Authority”), or other areas, to which

this Act applies.

(2) The rate of such fee, in respect of each type of building situated

within the area of any of the Authority and the areas to which this

Act applies, shall be such as specified in Schedule-II.” ;

(2) in sub-section (3),—

(a) for the words “The Authority may” the words “The Authority,

and in the areas outside the limits of the Authorities to which this

Act applies, the Director may,” shall be substituted ;

(b) in the proviso,—

(i) for the words “the Authority may,” the words “the

Authority, and in the areas outside the limits of the Authorities

to which this Act applies, the Director may,” shall be substituted ;

(ii) for the words “the minimum rate specified in the said

Schedule” the words “the rate specified in the said Schedule”

shall be substituted ;

 (3) in sub-section (4),—

(a) after the words “the Authority” the words “or the Director”

shall be inserted ;

(b) for the words “Fire Services” the words “Fire and Emergency

Services” shall be substituted.

7. In section 12 of the principal Act,—

(1) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,

namely :—

“(1A) The Director, on receipt of an application or suo moto,

before enhancing or reducing the  enhanced rate and levying the fee

at such rate, shall obtain the previous sanction of the State

Government to the proposal.” ;

(2) in sub-section (2), after the words “the Authority” the words “or

the Director” shall be inserted ;

(3) in sub-section (3), in clause (a), after the words “The Authority”

the words “or the Director” shall be inserted ;

Amendment
of section 12
of Mah. III of

2007.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 7

(4) in the marginal note, after the word “Authority” the words “or

Director” shall be inserted.

8.   In section 13 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the portion beginning with the words “ the

minimum fees specified” and ending with the words “Parts of the said

Schedule” the words and letters “the fees specified against each type of

building in the said Schedule” shall be substituted ;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “The Authority may” the words

“The Authority, and in the areas outside the limits of the Authorities to

which this Act applies, the Director may” shall be substituted.

9. In section 14 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “ the Authority”, at both the

places where they occur, the words “the Authority, and in the areas

outside the limits of the Authorities to which this Act applies, the Director,”

shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “the Authority”, wherever they

occur , the words “the Authority, and in the areas outside the limits of the

Authorities to which this Act applies, the Director” shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (4), for the words “the Authority”, wherever they

occur, the words “the Authority, and in the areas outside the limits of the

Authorities to which this Act applies, the Director,” shall be substituted;

(4) in sub-section (6), for the words “the Authority”, at both the places

where they occur, the words “the Authority, and in the areas outside the

limits of the Authorities to which this Act applies, the Director,” shall be

substituted;

(5) in sub-section (7), in clause (b), for the words “the Authority” the

words “the Authority, and in the areas outside the limits of the Authorities

to which this Act applies, the Director,” shall be substituted.

10. In section 16 of the principal Act,—

(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,

namely :—

“(1) Where it appears to the State Government that the balance

of the Fire Protection Fund of any Authority or Director is insufficient

for meeting any expenditure required to be incurred for purchasing

and maintaining fire fighting equipments and property and for

maintenance thereof or for creating posts of officers, staff and servants

for meeting the requirements to provide Fire and Emergency Services

Amendment
of section 14
of Mah. III of
2007.

Amendment
of section 16
of Mah. III of
2007.

Amendment
of section 13
of Mah. III of
2007.



8 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945

Amendment
of section 18
of Mah. III of

2007.

Amendment
of section 19
of Mah. III of

2007.

Amendment
of section 21
of Mah. III of

2007.

Amendment
of section 24
of Mah. III of

2007.

Amendment
of section 22
of Mah. III of

2007.

Amendment
of Chapter V
of Mah. III of

2007.

or generally, for performance of fire fighting operations; or that such

balance is more than the requirements for the purposes aforesaid,

the State Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette,

require the Authority or Director to enhance the rate of fee or reduce

the enhanced fee, if any, at such rate as may be specified in the said

notification.”;

(2) in the marginal note, after the word “Authority”, the words

“or Director” shall be inserted.

11. In Chapter V, for the heading “DIRECTOR OF FIRE SERVICES”

the heading “DIRECTOR OF FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES” shall be

substituted.

12. In section 18 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “Director of Fire Services” the

words “Director of Fire and Emergency Services” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “fire services”  the words “Fire

and Emergency Services” shall be substituted.

13. In section 19 of the principal Act,—

(1) the words, brackets and figure “sub-section (3) of” shall be deleted;

(2) for the words “fire services”  wherever they occur, the words “Fire

and Emergency Services” shall be substituted.

14. In section 21 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “fire services” the words “Fire

and Emergency Services” shall be substituted;

(2) in the marginal note, for the words “fire services” the words “Fire

and Emergency Services” shall be substituted.

15. In section 22 of the principal Act,—

(1) for the words “Fire Service”, “fire service”, “fire services” or “fire

service or services”, wherever they occur, the words “Fire and Emergency

Services” shall be substituted;

(2) in the marginal note, for the words “Maharashtra Fire Services”

the words “Maharashtra Fire and Emergency Services” shall be

substituted.

16. In section 24 of the principal Act, for the words “fire service” the

words “Fire and Emergency Services” shall be substituted.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 9

17. In section 27 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1),—

(a) for the words “of fire” the words “of fire or any emergency

situation” shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (a), for the words “for extinguishing the fire or for

saving life or property” the words “for extinguishing the fire or

responding to any emergency situation for saving life or property”

shall be substituted;

(c) in clause (b), after the words “fire is burning” the words “or

any emergency situation  has arisen” shall be inserted;

(d) in clause (c), after the words “extinguishing fire” the words

“or dealing with any emergency situation” shall be inserted;

(e) in clause (e), after the words “fire-fighting” the words “or

handling of any emergency situation” shall be inserted;

(f) in clause (f), for the words “extinguishing the fire or the

protection of life or property” the words “extinguishing the fire or

dealing with any emergency situation for the protection of life or

property” shall be substituted ;

(2) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted,

namely :—

“(2) Any damage done to any premises or property, on the

occasion of fire or any emergency situation, by members of the Fire

and Emergency Services in the due discharge of their duties shall be

deemed to be damage by fire or any emergency situation within the

meaning of any policy of insurance against fire or insurance for any

emergency situation.”;

(3) after sub-section (2), the following Explanation shall be added,

namely :—

“Explanation.– For the purpose of this section, the expression

“emergency situation” means any manmade or natural disaster or

any eventuality where the life or property is at risk.” ;

(4) in the marginal note, after the word ‘‘ fire ’’ the words ‘‘ or any

emergency situation ’’ shall be added.

18. In section 29 of the principal Act,—

(1) after the words “fire-fighting purposes” the words “or dealing

with any emergency situation” shall be inserted;

(2) for the word “fires” the words “fires or any emergency situation”

shall be substituted.

Amendment
of section 29
of Mah. III of
2007.

Amendment
of section 27
of Mah. III of
2007.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---2



10 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945

Amendment
of section 32
of Mah. III of

2007.

Amendment
of section 33
of Mah. III of

2007.

Amendment
of section 45
of Mah. III of

2007.

Insertion of
section 45A in

Mah. III of
2007.

Fire and Life
Safety Audit

of certain
buildings.

19. In section 32 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),—

(1) before clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(1-a) Fire Safety Approval issued under sub-section (1) of section

3, or”;

(2) after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(bb) order under sub-section (3) or  (4) of section 9, or”;

(3) after clause (c), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(d) order under sub-section (5) or (6) of section  45A;”.

20. In section 33 of the principal Act, in clause (a),—

(1)  for sub-clause (i), the following sub-clause shall be substituted,

namely :—

“(i) under clause (1-a), (a), (b), (bb) or (d)  of sub-section (1) of

section 32 is brought within thirty days from the date of issue of Fire

Safety Approval or from the date of service of notice or the date on

which the refusal is communicated to the appellant or from the date

of issue of order ;”;

(2) in the proviso, for the words “fifteen days” the words “thirty days”

shall be substituted.

21. In section 45 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), the heading

“Building with height more than 30 meters and used for,—” shall be numbered

as clause (a) and after clause (a), as so numbered, the following clause shall be

added, namely :—

“(b) Building used as,—

(1) residential building  with height more than 70 meters;

(2) large oil and natural gas installation such as refineries, LPG

bottling plant and other similar facilities;

(3) industrial building with moderate hazardous activities in

nature having built up area 30,000 square meters or more and

industrial building with high hazardous activities in nature having

built up area of  10,000 square meters or more.”.

22. After section 45 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

inserted, namely :—

“45A. (1) (a) Fire and Life Safety Audit shall be carried out by the

owner, or where the owner is not traceable, the occupier of a building, for

all the occupancies mentioned in sub-section (1) of section 45 by licensed



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 11

Fire and Life Safety Auditor and such Fire and Life Safety Audit shall be

carried out within a period of one year from the date of commencement

of Maharashtra Fire Prevention and Life Safety Measures (Amendment)

Act, 2023 and thereafter, once in every two years.

(b) The owner or occupier, as the case may be, shall furnish to the

Director or Chief Fire Officer or the nominated officer, a certificate in the

prescribed form issued by a licensed Fire and Life Safety Auditor

regarding the evaluation of the fire prevention and life safety measures

in his such building or part thereof, as required by or under the provisions

of this Act or rules made thereunder.

Explanation.—For the purposes of the Act, the expression “Fire and

Life Safety Audit” means the evaluation of fire prevention and life safety

measures required as per prevalent Acts or rules or National Building

Code of India in force.

(2) The Director may grant any person or association of persons as

he thinks fit, a licence to act as a Fire and Life Safety Auditor for the

purposes of this Act possessing such qualifications and experience as

may be prescribed.

(3) The duties and responsibilities of such auditor shall be such as

may be prescribed.

(4) Any person intending to have or renew such licence shall apply

to the Director in the prescribed form and in the prescribed manner. Such

application shall bear such court-fee stamp as may be prescribed and

shall be accompanied by the prescribed fee.

(5) On receipt of such application, the Director may, after holding

such inquiry as he deems fit, either grant the licence in the prescribed

form for a period of two years or renew the same for a like period or, for

reasons to be recorded in writing, by order refuse to grant or renew the

licence.

(6) Where the Director has reason to believe that any person to

whom a licence has been granted has contravened any provisions of this

Act or of the rules made thereunder or failed to comply with the conditions

of the licence or is unfit by reason of incompetency, misconduct or any

other grave reason, the Director may, after giving reasonable opportunity

to show cause, for reasons to be recorded in writing, by order suspend or

cancel the licence.

(7) No person other than a licensed Fire and Life Safety Auditor shall

carry out the work of fire audit or perform such other related activities

required to be carried out in any place or building or part thereof.

Mah. XXIV
of 2023.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---2+



12 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945

(8) No Fire and Life Safety Auditor or any other person claiming to

be such Fire and Life Safety Auditor shall give a certificate under sub-

section (1) regarding the evaluation of the fire prevention and life safety

measures are in good and efficient condition, without there being actual

such fire prevention and life safety measures.”.

23. After section 48 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

inserted, namely :—

“48A. (1) Where the State Government is satisfied that it is

necessary or expedient to do so, for the purposes of implementation of

any Part of the National Building Code of India relating to protection of

life and property, it may, by notification in the Official Gazette, amend

Schedule-I and thereupon, the said Schedule shall be deemed to have

been amended accordingly.

(2) Every notification issued under sub-section (1) shall be laid before

each House of State Legislature.”.

24. For Schedule-I and Schedule-II appended to the principal Act, the

following Schedules shall be substituted, namely :—

Insertion of
section 48A in

Mah. III of
2007.

Power to
amend

Schedule-I.

Substitution
of  Schedule-I
and Schedule

-II of Mah. III
of 2007.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 13



14 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 15



16 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 17

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---3



18 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 19

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---3+



20 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 21



22 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 23



24 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 25

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---4



26 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 27

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---5



28 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 29



30 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 31

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---6



32 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 33

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--42---6+



34 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 35



36 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945

SCHEDULE II

(See section 11)

Fire and Emergency Service Fee Structure

1. The Fire and Emergency Service Fee shall be levied as indicated in TABLE

given below as per square meter of the built up area for the various categories

of the building in accordance to percentage of the Annual Statements of Rates

(ASR) as published under the provisions of the Maharashtra Stamp (Determination

of True Market Value of Property) Rules, 1995 made under the Maharashtra

Stamp Act (LX of 1958).

TABLE

Sr. Height of the   Percentage of the Annual Statement of Rates (ASR)

No. Building in meters
Residential Institutional Commercial Industrial

1 Building upto 45 m 0.25% 0.50% 0.75% 0.75%

2 Building above 45m 0.50% 0.75% 1.00% 1.00%

2. The categorization of the occupancies in paragraph 1 above shall be

as categorized in Part 4 of the National Building Code of India, regarding  Fire

and Life Safety, which are as follows :—

(a) “Residential Building” means Residential Occupancies as mentioned

in Group A of Part 4 of the said Code except Sub-Groups A-5 and

A-6 thereof, viz. Lodging, Boarding, Dormitories, Apartment, Multi-level

car parking and Mechanized Automated Car Parking.

(b) “Institutional Building” means Educational Occupancies as

mentioned in Group B of Part 4 of the said Code and Institutional Occupancies

in Group C of Part 4 of the said Code, viz. School, College, University,

Hospital, Nursing Home, etc.

(c) “Commercial Building” means Occupancies as mentioned in Sub-

Groups A-5 and A-6 of Part 4 of the said Code and Assembly Occupancies

in Group D of Part 4 of the said Code, Business Occupancies in Group E

of Part 4 of the said Code and Mercantile Occupancies in Group F of

Part 4 of the said Code, viz. Hotels, Eateries, Malls, Multiplex, Theatres,

Shops, etc.

(d) “Industrial  Building” means Industrial Occupancies as mentioned

in Group G of Part 4 of the said Code, Storage Occupancies in Group H

of Part 4 of the said Code (excluding Multi-level car parking) and Hazardous

Occupancies in Group J of Part 4 of the said Code.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 11, 2023/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 21,  ¶ÉEäò 1945 37

Notes :—The fee for the above classification of the building shall be calculated

as under :—

1. The fee after computing the necessary percentage of the ASR shall

be multiplied by the built up area of the building under consideration for necessary

approval.

2. For the purposes of assessment of fee, the built-up area shall be gross

built-up area, which includes area of basement, easements, stilts, podium, stair-

cases, lifts, lobbies, passages, balconies, cantilever portions, service floors, refuge

areas, etc., as shown in the building plan certified by the Architect and submitted

to the Authority alongwith the application for permission for construction of

a building. The built-up area to be calculated for this purpose will have no

relation with the floor space index or the built-up area calculated in any other

manner.

3. The fees to be calculated shall be taken from lowest level to the

last livable floors and not slab-wise while determining height of the building

as indicated in TABLE.

4. For the purposes of assessment of fee, the Annual Statement of Rates

published under the provisions of the Bombay Stamp (Determination of True

Market Value of Property) Rules, 1995 are the building construction rates issued

by the Department of Registration and Stamps, Government of Maharashtra.

5. No fee shall be levied for the building identified as Sub-Groups A-2

and A-4 below 15 meters occupancies as per Part 4 of the National Building

Code of India, Part 4 and for all those buildings identified in section 15 of

the Act.”.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A,
NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


